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EA: Lara, I want to start by thanking you for taking the time to speak with me and to 

explain to our Digital Humanities class about your work. As you know, I’m incredibly interested 
in your Mapping Arts Project, which has led to some interesting developments in my own 
pedagogical aspirations. Could you tell us a little bit about what the Mapping Arts Project is, 
and where it is headed? 

 
LSP: The Mapping Arts Project is a primarily web-based project that maps cities through 

places where artists have lived and worked historically. The project is online at 
mappingartsproject.org, and includes Miami and Providence so far. Denver and Chicago are in 
development. The project includes archival, spatial, artistic, and ethnographic research and 
materials. Future plans include continual technological improvement such as the use of mobile 
locational technologies and the redevelopment of the website to show a global map (vs city 
maps). In the Spring I'll be working with students in the course, "Geographies of the Arts," to 
launch Mapping Arts-Denver.  

 
 
EA: Could you explain what started the project? What were some of the biggest 

challenges (knowledge of coding etc., economically, gaining interest, etc.) you faced, and ones 
you may still be facing, when you started this?  

 
 LSP: I started the project in 2009, while doing ethnographic fieldwork for my 
dissertation on contemporary arts. I wanted to find a book that would tell me about the history 
of the arts in Miami. I could not find such a book. Instead,  I began to conduct archival, 
ethnographic, and historical research. At first, I thought the project would be a short-lived 
participatory art project. But, the more research I did, the more I realized it needed to be a 
bigger project. That's when I designed and developed the website - to be able to create a 
broadly accessible and continually growing project.  Some of the biggest challenges in the 
beginning were time and funds to do the initial web development. Oh, also, finding the right 
team to work with. I have kept the project manageable thus far. Eventually, I will need to raise 
funds again to expand the technological capabilities of the project. 

 
 
EA: As a class, we have discussed the importance of collaboration in DH. We have also 

discussed the stigma that collaboration can hold in a university system because of the ever-
present importance placed on the individual as creator–– particularly when it comes to tenure 
position candidacy. How important has collaboration been to your project, and how do you 
view collaboration as far as the percentage of the work belonging to you v. shared? 

 



LSP: Collaboration is critical in my work! In the Mapping Arts Project as well as in other 
projects. In terms of the academic system and the stigma of collaboration, I think it's a matter 
of being able to define and present the work one does or the work one designs and 
conceptualizes vs truly joint projects. It is not possible to work completely alone. Well, I'm sure 
some people do, but most rely on others. There are many ways to collaborate -  sharing ideas 
on individual projects, hiring a web team or photographer, jointly organizing a series of events - 
that further both the collaborative and individual goals.  

 
 
EA: Following this, as mentioned above, collaboration is not usually viewed favorably in 

the university. Why do you think this is, and what needs to be done, if anything, in your 
opinion, to change this mindset? 

 
LSP: Mostly I think the idea of what can be done with academic knowledge and research 

needs to shift. With that shift would also come the awareness of what "counts" as scholarship. 
There is an organization I work with, Imagining America, and they have done a lot of work 
around this idea and have some productive suggestions on moving forward. 

 
 
EA: Would you shed some light for us on the RAP Lab, what is the RAP Lab, what are you 

working on currently, what is it that makes the RAP Lab an actual laboratory? 
 
LSP: The RAP Lab is a interdisciplinary space with multiple ongoing projects. It is a new 

space on campus, started by English professor Adam Bradley. Some of the projects include a 
Global Hip Hop project, a project to bring Ralph Ellison's Invisible Man to life through digital 
technology, and now that I'm a Postdoc, the Mapping Arts Project. It's a Lab in the sense that 
it's a space for innovative work that is pushing boundaries. In the Lab, we are testing out new 
ways of working and new ideas.  

 
  
EA: Many of us in class have expressed interest with incorporating more DH into our 

classrooms. How much do you use in your own classroom? What advice would you give to 
those of us just starting out–– what advantages or drawbacks have you experienced?  

 
LSP: I use DH in my classroom as much as it seems to makes sense for the course and 

the topic. I try to integrate technology and all kinds of media to create a rich learning 
experience. My advice in terms of integrating DH in the classroom would be to make use of 
campus resources. ASSETT has workshops and individuals on staff to work with students and 
faculty. In my previous postdoc at Brown, I found resources on campus very helpful in my work 
and in my teaching. See above re collaboration.  

 
 



EA: Following this, we spoke briefly last week about your upcoming class for the Spring 
2016 semester. Could you explain what the class is, what you hope to do with it, and how DH 
might be involved?–– 

 
LSP: 


